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Decision on pvt
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The committee earlier sat 
twice in this regard and 
prepared a draft titled 
“Institutional Practice 
Guideline”.

According to the plan, 
the system would be 
introduced at 83 public 
hospitals from March as 
the government looks to get 
more use out of the existing 
healthcare infrastructure.

The programme, which 
will begin on a pilot basis 
next month, will be rolled 
out at all public hospitals 
by August.

It’s hard to trust
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the gold bars, some of the 
ornaments and the cell 
phones. With the money, 
he started constructing a 
one-story building at his in-
law’s house and bought a 
motorcycle. A portion of it 
was also spent on repaying 
the loans he made for going 
to Dubai. 

Mujibur eventually filed 
a case against Shawon, his 
brother Md Nirob and two 
others with the Airport 
police station on February 9.

Lalbagh Zone of DMP’s 
Detective Branch DB 

finally arrested Shawon on 
Wednesday from his rented 
house in Bogura. Around 
Tk 4.5 lakh, five tolas of 
gold and the cellphones 
were recovered from him. 

Shawon is currently 
under a two-day remand by 
DB.

Additional Deputy 
Commissioner of Lalbagh 
Zone of DB Mostafa Kamal, 
who led the drive, said they 
are trying to arrest the 
man to whom Shawon sold 
the gold at almost half the 
actual price and recover the 
rest of the gold.

Involvement
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During the hearing, 
Prothom Alo Editor 
Matiur Rahman submitted 
an affidavit to the HC 
bench through its 
lawyer Prashanta Kumar 
Karmoker saying that 
the report and editorial 
published in his daily over 
the incident are authentic 
and true.

The HC ordered the OC 
to submit the investigation 
report to this court and to 
inform it what action has 
been taken to this effect by 
April 4.

During the hearing, the 
HC had Shahriar Alam, 
senior vice president of 
Bagmara’s Shubhadanga 
union, stand in the 
courtroom for around one 
and half hours and ordered 
him to further appear 
before it on April 4.

Deputy Attorney 
General Wayesh-Al-Haroni 
represented the state 
during the hearing.

Two slaps and off
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Shahrukh and Rifat. From 
the college BCL faction, 
Rafi, Imon, Torikul, Raju, 
Hasan and Ahsan were 
involved in the attack, said 
the students.

All of them are followers 
of BCL college unit’s 
president Rashik Dutta, 
they added.

In the meeting, Rashik 
admitted his responsibility 
for the attacks.

During the meeting, 
he allegedly slapped the 
attackers and sought 
pardon for them from the 
college authorities.

After a lengthy 
discussion with the college 
principal in the chair, the 
college authorities decided 
to pardon the BCL men 
involved when its leaders 
promised to punish them.

“We wanted justice, 
but we had nothing to 
do as our teachers and 
senior journalists were in 
the meeting,” said Abdul 
Hakim, president of the 
college’s reporters’ unity.

The college authorities 
promised to take a strong 
stance against such 
incidents in future and said 
they will ensure the safety 
and security of all students 
on campus, Hakim reported.

“Everyone agreed on the 

decisions to maintain peace 
on the campus,” said Rafiqul 
Islam, president of Rajshahi 
Union of Journalists.

Contacted, Principal 
Prof Md Abdul Khaleque 
told The Daily Star that 
they pardoned the BCL 
men as they were outsiders 
and the others were not 
involved in the attack.

Asked about students’ 
demand for legal action, the 
principal argued that the 
BCL leaders punished the 
attackers themselves and 
promised the authorities 
to remove them from the 
organisation.

However, Prof Khaleque 
mentioned that the 
authorities pardoned 
another BCL member for a 
similar attack on a student 
a week ago. “We are yet to 
hear of any organisational 
punitive measure taken 
against the attacker by 
BCL.”

Asked why authorities 
pardoned them this time 
too, he said they have been 
pardoned for the last time.

Constable dies
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vehicle and it rammed into 
Emon’s bike.

Emon fell on the road 
and suffered serious head 
injuries, said the OC, 
adding that locals  took him 
to Kalaroa Health Complex 
where doctors declared 
him brought dead.

The OC said the body 
was sent to Satkhira 
Sadar Hospital morgue 
for autopsy. The truck has 
been seized but its driver 
managed to flee. 

Emon’s father Monayem 
Hossain said his son 
came to Satkhira from 
Rangamati a week ago after 
taking leave from work. He 
has a five-year-old son.

Look beyond
FROM PAGE 3

an ethnic group. Such 
problems were there for 
many years.

“Rohingya crisis... is in no 
way a Bangladesh problem. 
It has regional and global 
consequences and so the 
world community must 
come forward to address 
it,” he said.

While repatriation may 
take time, the funding for 
Rohingyas is declining, 
which is creating another 
challenge for Bangladesh 
and Rohingya. Lack of basic 
amenities in the Rohingya 
camps can lead to bigger 
problems, he added.

Former ambassador 
Munshi Faiz Ahmad 
said the ICJ case, the US 
determination of Rohingya 
persecution as genocide, 
and sanctions by the US, 
Canada and European 
countries are some of the 
important efforts and 

stronger initiatives should 
be built upon them for a 
sustainable solution to the 
Rohingya crisis.

BIISS Director General 
Maj Gen Sheikh Pasha 
Habib Uddin, Lt Gen (Retd) 
Mohammad Mahfuzur 
Rahman, Dr Niloy Ranjan 
Biswas of DU’s International 
Relations, and BIISS 
research fellow ASM Tarek 
Hassan Semul also spoke.
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After 6 years’
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He declined to disclose 
more details about the 
report.

Diaz was found hanged 
in his flat near CU campus 
on November 20, 2016. His 
family then filed a murder 
case against 10 Chhatra 
League members of CU 
unit and a former assistant 
proctor of the university.


