
LATE S. M. ALI

FOUNDER EDITOR

DHAKA SATURDAY OCTOBER 19, 2002

 TO THE EDITORTO THE EDITOR  TO THE EDITOR TO THE EDITOR  TO THE EDITOR  

A necessary move 
Success will depend on how the PM 
resists party pressure to protect own peo-
ple

I
T is never easy for a democratically elected govern-

ment to call in the army to do a civil government's job. 

For such a move amounts to an admission that the 

established channels have failed. Bringing in the army 

also risks alienating the police, the bureaucracy with all 

their attending institutions which are responsible for main-

taining law and order in the country. Khaleda Zia has taken 

a big gamble in calling in the army. However it is a gamble 

that had to be taken and one which has been and will con-

tinue to be welcomed by the general public provided that it 

is not used for political end. It must be recalled that the 

previous drives against criminals launched by the police 

and then by a combination of police and BDR all failed 

because the moves were partisan and as such compro-

mised. Once they started catching the politically con-

nected criminals the drives came under pressure and 

were soon stopped or made ineffective.

Such mistakes of the earlier attempts cannot be permit-

ted to recur. It is the neutral aspect of the army deployment 

that must be most meticulously observed. Here we must 

point out that one of the main reasons for police failure is 

the politicisation of that vital force and its partisan use. 

That blunder must not be repeated with the army. Under 

no circumstances should the army's neutral role and 

image be compromised through this operation. While the 

government must ensure it, at the same time the army's 

leadership must most vigilantly guard against any distor-

tion of it. From reports received so far we feel satisfied that 

criminals of all shades and political connections have 

been rounded up. If this 'neutrality' is maintained then we 

feel the initial public and media support behind the deploy-

ment will continue.

 The government must also be painfully aware of the 

limitations of the army deployment; the most important of 

which is that it cannot be allowed to last for long. By defini-

tion an army operation must be surgical in nature and as 

such time bound -- the shorter the better. Here again the 

less the political interference with its work, the more effi-

cient will be the army's operation and faster it will be able to 

return to the barracks.

The success of this deployment will depend on the co-

operation of the government and more specifically the role 

of the ruling party and its leadership. As the army will start 

catching the criminals and as more and more of them will 

turn out to be ruling party cadres and activists pressure will 

mount on the Prime Minister who is also the BNP chief to 

spare her party men. Ministers who are well known to have 

own personal gangs and to protect criminals will start lob-

bying for those under their protection. BNP leaders them-

selves will start telling the party chief that the army move is 

'destroying' the party as so many of its 'vital leaders' are 

being caught and the party morale is disappearing fast. 

The argument will be put forward by such protectors of 

criminals that AL is gaining because the mastans are join-

ing the opposition. Against all such pleas and lobbying the 

BNP chief must be absolutely firm and totally uncompro-

mising. More the PM stays firm the bigger will be the public 

support behind her. But if she buckles under party pres-

sure the credibility of this whole operation will go down the 

drain.

We need to ask a fundamental question here as to why it 

become necessary to deploy the army to catch common 

criminals. The answer is simple. It is the political 

patronisation of criminals that has brought the situation to 

this pass. It is true that today we do not have the high pro-

file political criminals like the Hazaris, Maqbuls, Osmans, 

Iqbals etc. But make no mistake hundreds of their smaller 

versions are in operation and most of them are under the 

protections of BNP leaders. Many districts are now under 

the grip of criminal gangs protected and patronised by the 

local BNP leadership just as another set of criminals-or 

perhaps the same set- was protected by the former AL 

government.

Khaleda Zia needs to be commended for deploying the 

army. But she will have to allow them to operate freely if 

she wants her bold step to bear fruit. She must remember 

that it was political patronisation of criminals that made the 

law and order situation so bad that compelled her to call in 

the army and it will be removing that patronisation which 

will ensure her government's success.

A
MERICA has now a Peace 
President (former President 
Carter) and a "war" Presi-
dent. Interesting! It's more 

interesting as Oslo Nobel Peace 
Committee chose particularly this 
time to honour former President 
Jimmy Carter by awarding Nobel 
Peace Prize for his untiring work for 
over a decade for peaceful resolu-
tions of many conflicts around the 
world. This was undoubtedly a great 
decision of the Nobel Peace Com-
mittee as one sees this as a very 
correct step to promote peaceful 
resolution of any world conflict 
without resorting to any violent 
means that kill men women and 
children - undoubtedly a solid vote 
against the war. 

However, unfortunate is the 
majority vote of the US Congress 
(House 296-133 and Senate 77-23) 
that approved a resolution to 
'authorise President Bush to use 
force against Iraq,' This resolution 
virtually gave dictatorial power to 
President Bush. One wonders how 
the Congress, the representatives 
of the people of a democratic coun-
try like America could give away the 
peoples' power to one individual  
the President! But in any case, this 
was not 'America speaks with one 
voice' that the UNSC and the inter-
national community should take 
note of. There were reportedly 
serious differences of opinion in the 
Congress. Apart from Former Vice 
President Al-Gore, Senators like 
Robert Byrd, Edward Kennedy, M 
Jeffords, House Representatives 
like Barbara Miklusky John Lewis, 
David Bonoir and many others 
spoke and voted against the resolu-
tion.' 

The trickiest part was White 
House's move to have the resolution 
before November mid term election. 
The fear was that any move to go 

against the resolution could be 
interpreted by the American voters 
as move against the national secu-
rity and could bring electoral defeat 
to the Democratic party. But the 
latest survey by the Pew Research 
Centre shows that '.. 55 percent 
(Americans) said the economy, and 
not Iraq, was really the most impor-
tant issue for the upcoming con-
gressional election'. Therefore the 
fear of the Democrats was some-
what misplaced. In any case, war is 
an extremely dangerous thing and 

would certainly lead to considerable 
American and Iraqi casualties. As 
Iraq would be battered by all the 
deadly weapons, unarmed civilian 
deaths and particularly of women 
and children would be extremely 
high. Undoubtedly this will disturb 
the world peace. In such a situation 
politics should not have played any 
role. 

America is a great country and 
the world expected its representa-
tives to use their conscience and not 
immediate political considerations 
to determine the super power's role 
in this complex world. They should 
have at least seriously taken into 
consideration the assessment 
reports of the most important Intelli-
gence Agency  the CIA. There are 
reports of differences of opinion 
between CIA and the White House 
on whether there is any imminent 
danger that America faces from 
Iraq. NY Times report [10/10/02] 
said that the CIA 'do not support the 
White House's view that Iraq pres-
ents an immediate threat to the 
American homeland and may use Al 
Qaidah to carry out attacks at any 
moment.'' Then why such a rush? 
Indeed, CIA also warned that 'a US 
attack may ignite terror' which some 
of us clearly highlighted weeks ago 
in our comments. Recently French 
President Jacques Chirac himself 
expressed the view that any attack 

on Iraq would increase terrorism. 
The Congress should have 

waited for the results of the adminis-
tration's consultation with other 
members of the UNSC. Even after 
the votes, several Senators 
expressed the view that the US 
should continue to follow the UNSC 
path. Therefore, it will be prudent for 
President Bush to go by the decision 
of the UNSC in this complex and 
highly sensitive issue that is bound 
to affect the entire world. 

It will be highly dangerous to 
depend only on Prime Minister Tony 
Blair just to show it as an alliance as 
he himself has no support of the 
Party and the people of Britain to go 
beyond multilateral path. His visit to 
Moscow to secure support of Presi-
dent Putin was described by some 
as  "humiliating" and some British 
news papers were very critical of 
Blair's role and his visit to Moscow. 
President Putin was very assertive 
and said he had 'no proof of Iraq's 
having weapons of mass destruc-
tion and there was no legal ground 
to launch an attack on Iraq'. Similar 
views have also been expressed by 
President Chirac. The most humili-
ating was Putin's remark that British 
dossier which Tony Blair placed 
before the Parliament contained 
materials of 'propaganda.' Of 
course, a British MP also described 
the materials in the dossier as 
"fiction". Putin, however, said that 
he was prepared to consider any 
move to have a resolution that could 
strengthen the hands of the weap-
ons inspectors. This virtually meant 
support to French proposal for two 
resolutions and not to the one 
demanded by the US. 

France, Russia, China and 
practically all other rotating mem-
bers of the UNSC has so far 
remained against America's one 
resolution that should include 

automatic attack on Iraq in case Iraq 
fails to comply with the demands of 
the UNSC. Over 100 Ambassadors 
of the member states of the UN in 
their open debate spoke against the 
America's possible war against Iraq.  
In such a situation, it is surprising 
that a diplomat like Dr Hans Blix 
gave support to a new resolution 
and said he and his Inspection team 
would wait for such a new UNSC 
mandate.  One feels that it was 
inappropriate on his part to go to 
only Washington and not to other 

capitals of the permanent members 
after the UNSC briefing. One would 
obviously like to know whether Hans 
Blix, being an employee of the UN 
got any clearance from the UN SG 
for such a visit? Dr. Blix very clearly 
said earlier in Vienna that ' UNSC is 
his master and not Washington'. 
Why such a sudden change? This 
has unfortunately raised some 
questions about his total neutrality 
in the inspection affair. The issue is 
brought in specifically as his support 
stalled the dispatch of the weapons 
inspectors to Iraq, which was to take 
place today, October 19. If his team 
started to work, President Saddam 
would not have got the extra time as 
he has under the present stalemate.

NY Times reported " Rumsfeld 
Orders War Plans Redone For 
Faster Action." Indeed, battle forces 
are moving to Kuwait, Qatar and 
other places in the region. One 
wonders what has happened to the 
Arab decision taken at a summit in 
Beirut some months ago against 
any attack against any Arab country. 
The war equipment are being 
brought in obviously with approval 
of the countries like Kuwait, Qatar. If 
these are for attacking Iraq which 
appears to be the case, then what 
would be the position of Arab coun-
tries? Saudi Arabia reportedly said it 
would not allow any attack from 
Saudi soil. Egypt, Jordan are 

expected to have similar position. 
Kuwait reportedly said that its forces 
would not participate in any war. But 
is Kuwait under any obligation to 
allow its soil to be used for launching 
the attack? What about Qatar, 
Bahrain, Yemen and also Turkey? 
As Rumsfeld is in a great hurry, the 
world would obviously like to know 
the positions of these countries.

As it appears, the resolution 
passed by the US Congress did not 
include the issue of "Regime 
Change". But some reports say that 

the White House has been prepar-
ing the plan for occupation of Iraq 
and it reportedly went to the extent 
of mentioning Tommy Frank as the 
Head of Iraq's administration after 
the fall of President Saddam 
Hussein. Is Tommy Frank going to 
be the (temporary) President of 
Iraq? This can happen only after the 
death of Saddadm who received 
100 per cent  "yes" vote on October 
15 referendum that gave him 
another 7 years in office. In Iraq it's a 
dictatorial democracy but undoubt-
edly a decision of some sort of the 
people and a not a decision of the 
court. 

In any case, any American war 
will result in very high Iraqi casual-
ties and that number will certainly be 
many times higher than what Presi-
dent Saddam achieved in 23 years 
by killing and 'gassing his own 
people'. Then how could Tommy 
Frank be a better replacement, if his 
temporary accession to Saddam's 
throne leads to colossal deaths? 
Moreover, how would he fit in the 
midst of so many Arab heads of 
states? Arabs are already tired of 
Sharon and with Tommy Frank, the 
things may turn really uncontrolla-
ble. If this is a fact (this has report-
edly been denied by the White 
House but whether denied or not, a 
regime change must have a 
replacement plan), then one would 

wonder about the next step of the 
White House in the region. Because 
there must be some reasons for a 
regime change in Iraq and the White 
House may find similar reasons in 
the other states of the region and 
nearby. 

However, many even in America 
are reportedly saying that regime 
change is necessary in Washington 
itself as the regime has not only 
failed to effectively control corporate 
corruption and deal with the serious 
slide in the economy but also failed 
to catch even a sniper  a mini 
Saddam - in the greater Washington 
area. When the regime fails to tackle 
a mini Saddam in Washington itself, 
then what is the justification for 
going after the bigger Saddam who 
is thousands of miles away and 
probably would not even think in his 
wildest dream of attacking America. 
Saddam simply does not have the 
materials and the means to do so. In 
the meantime, North Korea, a 
member of the same "axis of evil" 
has already developed the nuclear 
bomb. Is America in a position to do 
the same with North Korea? Proba-
bly not. 

Various reports say that there are 
three doubles of Saddam. Some 
say even more. Twelve years of 
deadly sanction has killed about half 
a million children and may be similar 
number of adults. But many of those 
who are still alive have been turned 
into mini Saddams by Bush Admin-
istration's verbal rhetoric, the actual 
is yet to come. Iraq warned it would 
be the toughest of all wars. But in 
any case, this war has already 
started  bombing and killing inno-
cents everywhere  the latest in Bali 
and in the southern Philippines. The 
terrorists can not be seen; they are 
the black cats  indeed wild and 
dangerous ones  in the darkness 
that the world has been thrown into 
since 9/11 and the darkness further 
deepened by the atrocities con-
ducted by Sharon against the inno-
cent Palestinians.  

Muslehuddin Ahmad is a former Secretary and 
Ambassador and founder president of  North 
South University

T
HE declared result of an 
election is not always the real 
result. You have to peel off a 
layer from fact in order to 

reach the meaning. Two elections 
have produced two outcomes in the 
second week of October, one in 
Jammu and Kashmir and the other 
in Pakistan. They had one thing in 
common. There was little immediate 
clarity about who won these elec-
tions. But there was great clarity 
about who had lost them. 

There were two principal losers 
in Jammu and Kashmir. One was Dr 
Farooq Abdullah. The other was 
P r e s i d e n t - G e n e r a l  P e r v e z  
Musharraf.  In Pakistan also there 
were two clear losers. The first was 
America. The second was the 
doub ly  un fo r tuna te  Pervez  
Musharraf. 

Farooq Abdullah's defeat is as 
understandable as is his unwilling-
ness to accept it. No one in power 
ever believes that he is going to 
lose. No one who has lost ever 
thinks it is anything but a conspiracy 
that has defeated him. Farooq 
Abdullah's defeat came fifteen 
years too late, in fact. He should 
have lost in 1987, when the popular 
mood in the valley had turned com-
pletely against the National Confer-
ence-Congress alliance. He was 
saved that year by rigging, just as he 
had been helped before by electoral 
manipulation. Arun Nehru, who was 
a critical player in Kashmir affairs 
from the years of Mrs Indira Gandhi, 

through most of the Rajiv Gandhi 
prime ministership and then into 
V.P.Singh's tenure, confirms this.  It 
was Arun Nehru's influence that 
played a substantial part in the first 
of the series of political mistakes 
that created this tragedy: the arbi-
trary dismissal of Farooq Abdullah's 
government in that catastrophic 
year of 1984 when Mrs Gandhi 
accelerated both the crises that 
bedeviled India for more than a 
decade, in Punjab and in Kashmir. 

Rajiv Gandhi tried to repair the 
damage of 1984 by an alliance with 
Farooq Abdullah for the 1987 elec-
tions.  It failed even before it had 
started. When Rajiv Gandhi and 
Farooq Abdullah discovered that 
they were losing the elections, out 
came the familiar solution. Ballot 
boxes from selected constituencies 
were stuffed with votes that had 
never been cast, and Farooq 
Abdullah was declared a winner. He 
can hardly be blamed if he is a little 
rusty now about fair elections. His 
son Omar may have a few questions 
hidden inside his legacy, but that is 
only one of the problems that he will 
have to deal with. 

President Musharraf need not 
have ended up with so much raw 
egg on his face.  He has the reputa-
tion of being a risk-taker. This is one 
occasion on which he may have felt 
he was not taking a risk, when he 
chose his speech on Pakistan's 
independence day to dismiss the 
autumn elections in Jammu and 
Kashmir as a farce. This was proba-
bly the assessment he was given by 
the ISI and the Pakistan embassy in 

Delhi. 
Dictatorship has this problem: 

you are told what you want to hear. 
Moreover, obsequiousness can be 
a courtier's revenge. But advice is 
not a decision. It was President 
Musharraf's call to make this a 
centerpiece of his message to 
Pakistan and then, rather unneces-
sarily, overdo the theme in his 
United Nations speech in New York 
in September. I suppose it is obliga-
tory on the part of a Pakistan leader 

to raise Kashmir at the United 
Nations, but it is not obligatory to be 
nasty. President Musharraf placed 
his government's credibility on his 
assessment of the Jammu and 
Kashmir election. That credibility 
lies in tatters before an international 
community that has endorsed the 
legitimacy of these polls. President 
Musharraf may have driven Paki-
stan into a corner at a sensitive 
juncture. 

Life in a corner has its dangers, 
mostly to others. There will be some 
temptation to blast apart the obvious 
satisfaction of Delhi in having lived 
up to its commitment and conducted 
free and fair elections, with credible 
participation by the people. The 
voter turnout matters less than the 
fact that the government was turned 
out. There was a visible rise in 
violence after the first round of polls 
disproved fears of virtual boycott. 
The democratic process held its 
nerve, with the candidates showing 
particular fortitude as conviction 
grew that this election would mean 
regime change.  Now that the 'farce' 
has proved to be a serious exercise 
in democracy, what might be the 

response from some elements 
across the line of control? A dra-
matic terrorist attack that will shatter 
the optimism in Srinagar, tauten 
nerves in Delhi and drive India and 
Pakistan back to the brink of war?  
The only hope against adventurism 
in Srinagar is confusion is 
Islamabad. The Pakistan election 
began on a strange note and kept 
getting weirder. This was not an 
election about change of power. The 
army was in power, and ensured, by 

amending the Constitution 23 times, 
that it would remain in power. It was 
a royal election, for the post of 
general manager rather than chief 
executive. The turnout was low, and 
the counting slow. There is little 
need to explain what that adds up to 
under a military regime. 

It would have been what it was 
meant to be, a cosmetic exercise, 
but for a startling message from the 
provinces bordering Afghanistan. A 
coalition of six religious parties, the 
Muttahida Majlis-I-Amal, campaign-
ing with Osama bin Laden's face on 
their posters, won 51 seats from the 
Frontier and Balochistan. The first 
implication is obvious. There is 
strong resentment against the 
American presence in Afghanistan. 
The second is oblique. If this is an 
indication of the mood in the 
Pashtun areas of Afghanistan then 
America has already created a pool 
of anger within the country it hoped 
to liberate from the supporters of 
Osama bin Laden. The conse-
quences of this anger will become 
apparent in the coming year. It is a 
fact that Washington will have to 

deal with as it continues its war on 
terrorism and seeks to expand this 
rationale to take on Iraq. 

In a royal election there has to be 
a King's Party. The Pakistan Muslim 
League (Q) duly emerged as the 
largest single party in the House, 
with 76 of the 269 seats declared at 
the time of writing. But this was more 
than one apple short of a picnic. 

The fact is that nearly two thirds 
of those elected to the Pakistan 
National Assembly even in a con-

trolled election where there was no 
hope of any change, are opposed to 
President Musharraf either because 
of his domestic policy or his foreign 
policy. In fact, he could find the 
clergy from the Frontier and 
Balochistan more of a worry than 
either or both of the exiles, Benazir 
Bhutto or Nawaz Sharif. Fundamen-
talists have always tried to hit above 
their weight in Pakistan's politics, 
but they have never quite traveled 
beyond the fringe. Musharraf's 
support for America's war against 
Osama (to be fair, he had no real 
option) has brought the clergy onto 
centrestage. This will impact not 
only Pakistan but the whole region, 
because they are the keepers of a 
cause that believes in jihad against 
America, India and, piquantly, the 
apostate in the middle, Pervez 
Musharraf.  (This is the real reason 
for the second defeat of Musharraf.) 
Common sense suggests the need 
for a common response. Experi-
ence suggests that it will not be 
forthcoming. 

For reasons that may or may not 
have anything to do with one 

another, these have been hinge 
elections. What happens after them 
will be more crucial than the elec-
tions themselves. A great deal will 
depend on how Islamabad deals 
with the rise of the clergy, whether it 
chooses to buy them, appease them 
or confront them. Policy, and 
events, will emerge out of this 
decision.  Delhi is more focused. 
Prime Minister Atal Behari Vajpayee 
pursued his commitment to free and 
fair elections even at the cost of his 
own party. The BJP would certainly 
have done better in a rigged poll. 
Vajpayee knew the outcome, which 
might explain why he did not go to 
the state to campaign for his party. 
Deputy Prime Minister Lal Krishna 
Advani took a significant step for-
ward when, on the eve of the results, 
he announced that Delhi was pre-
pared for talks with both the elected 
representatives of the Kashmiri 
people as well as those who had not 
participated in the elections. One 
hopes that similar sensitivity to 
ground reality, rather than an arid 
commitment to arithmetic will deter-
mine who will be the chief minister of 
the state after the formation of the 
alliance between the Congress and 
the party of the ex-Congressman, 
Mufti Mohammad Sayeed, the PDP. 
The Congress may have won 20 
seats against the PDP's 16. The 
more important fact is that the 
Congress defeated the BJP in 
Jammu, while it was the PDP that 
stopped the National Conference in 
Kashmir. The state has to be lead by 
the person who represents the 
valley rather than the plains. The 
problem is in Kashmir, not in 
Jammu. 

It is rare when an election 
becomes a basis for hope. Such an 
election has taken place in Jammu 
and Kashmir. If that hope were to be 
belied, we would lose another 
generation to the gun.

MJ Akbar is Chief Editor of the Asian Age.

America and the world split on war on Iraq

Some apples short of a picnic

MUSLEHUDDIN AHMAD

SPOTLIGHT ON MIDDLE EAST
Any American war will result in very high Iraqi casualties and that number will certainly be many times higher 
than what President Saddam achieved in 23 years by killing and 'gassing his own people'. Then how could 
Tommy Frank be a better replacement, if his temporary accession to Saddam's throne leads to colossal 
deaths? Moreover, how would he fit in the midst of so many Arab heads of states? Arabs are already tired of 
Sharon and with Tommy Frank, the things may turn really uncontrollable. 

M.J. AKBAR

BYLINE
There were two principal losers in Jammu and Kashmir. One was Dr Farooq Abdullah. The other was Presi-
dent-General Pervez Musharraf.  In Pakistan also there were two clear losers. The first was America. The sec-
ond was the doubly unfortunate Pervez Musharraf. 

An open letter to the 
US President
My wife and I are opposed to your 
war efforts against Iraq. Such an 
uncalled for and totally unjust war 
would be detrimental to our standing 
among the civilised nations who 
already have gotten tired of our 
bullying tactics. Look at the anti-war 
peace rallies across Europe and 
here in the States. Please, listen to 
the home-grown, at least for once.

Your talk of war is making us look 
more like an evil and a rogue nation, 
an epithet that you have often used 
against others. It is coming to haunt 
us now through your Administra-
tion's misguided policies in world 
affairs. America has to set a better 
standard for other nations to follow, 
and it cannot do so by being either a 
bully or an immoral entity, which is 
both hypocritical in its dealings and 
glorifies violence. 

We, who voted for you, did not 
expect things to go this way. We 
expected better from you. If you 
need advice, don't hesitate to listen 
to one who gives it sincerely without 
malice and prejudice. 
Dr. Habib Siddiqui 
Pennsylvania, USA

What a contradiction!
The idea of Bush trying to make the 
world peaceful and safer by waging 
war on Iraq is so absurd, that most 
American, English and even many 
Jewish people condemn it when-
ever they get an opportunity. What-
ever Mr Bush or Blair is "saying" 
about terrorism is quite true, but it is 
what they "do" that causes outrage 
even from their own people. 

Let's examine some facts: Tony 
Blair said on 7th September that 
"inaction was not an option". But he 
does absolutely nothing when Israel 
defies UN resolutions and kills 

innocent women and children. 
George Bush said on 11th Sept "We 
will not allow any terrorist or tyrant to 
threaten civilisation with weapons of 
mass destruction". But when Israel 
is wiping out the entire Palestinian 
civilisation, he calls Sharon a man of 
peace! He helps Israel with F16s 
and he ignores the fact that Israel 
also has nuclear weapon. Invading 
or helping someone to invade any 
country by force is against interna-
tional law. Why is America helping 
Israel in its invasion of Palestine? 
UK and US want to bomb Iraq for 
defying UN, yet US completely 
ignores UN when it doesn't serve its 
interests. 

What started as a "war on terror-
ism" has been carefully muddled up 
with the "war on Iraq", which now 
appears to be a "war on Islam"! 

There was a time when I used to 
blame US, Israel and the West for all 
the genocide committed against 

Muslims worldwide. But no more. It 
is Muslim leaders, and Muslim 
leaders alone who are responsible 
for the misery of other Muslim 
nations! When it comes to helping a 
Muslim country i.e. Palestine, they 
don't do anything. But when it 
comes to bombing a Muslim country 
i.e. Afghanistan, Iraq, a lot of Muslim 
countries volunteer to help US/UK 
by providing Air-bases i.e. Pakistan, 
Qatar, Egypt, Jordan etc. It is a 
disgrace for all the Muslims (includ-
ing myself)! 
Azad Miah 
Oldham, UK 

The new crusaders
We as moderate Muslims thank the 
US for fighting Islamic fundamental-
ists "Al Qaidah" and the "Taliban" 
and we are with the US 100% in its 
fight against terrorism and to seek 
justice and rid the world of such 
evils. But isn't it about time also to 

fight and curb the power and influ-
ence of Christen and Jewish Zionist 
fundamentalists who used and still 
using the might and power of the US 
government to implement theirs 
fundamentalist views, prophecies 
and agenda.

Those Christian and Jewish 
Zionists have succeeded in creating 
in 1948 their own "Taliban" govern-
ment in Palestine and called it 
"Israel" and wish to lead the world 
into destruction and have been 
terrorising the people of the Middle 
East and the world for that matter 
ever since.

As much as our Islamic funda-
mentalists do scare the West, 
Christen and Jewish fundamental-
ists are scaring and terrorising us in 
the Muslim World, particularly in the 
Middle East. What we are witness-
ing nowadays is a new crusader war 
waged by President Bush and his 
cabinet against any one opposes 

his Taliban "Israel".
For example when we examine 

his "axis of evil" Iraq, Iran, and North 
Korea. We find that none of these 
countries actually threatens the US, 
but in fact pose a threat to the secu-
rity of Israel. Iraq and Iran pose a 
direct threat while North Korea sells 
weapons to the other two.
Fahad Salamah
Abu Dhabi, UAE

Hiroshima redux
At every instance possible some 
contributors have a tendency to 
bring up the matter of the atomic 
bomb dropped at Hiroshima to end 
the World War II. The tragic event is 
portrayed less to sympathise with its 
victims and more to point a finger at 
certain countries. Rarely though is 
the incident considered in perspec-
tive.

It was a brutal, and tragic event. 
We must also keep in mind the fact 

that the then fascist and racist 
regime of Japan had vowed to fight 
till the last man, last bullet. The 
atomic bomb on Hiroshima may or 
may not have been the only option 
left to save Allied lives: wars by their 
nature leave moral questions unan-
swered for long. But it was not a 
decision taken in vacuum.

As someone whose grandfather 
and granduncle, on each side of the 
family, both put on the uniform to 
stand up to the German/Japanese 
Axis, I resent the presumption that 
somehow the Allies were the bad 
guys. Given the fact that the Japa-
nese bombed Chittagong and 
Calcutta multiple times killing many, 
I would like to see some criticism of 
the Japanese assault on our civil-
ians as well. Or is it that we are 
concerned about civilian casualties 
and war-related brutalities only 
when the Europeans and Ameri-
cans are in the dock? 

E S

Missouri, USA

Mahathir's memory
Malaysian Prime Minister Mahathir 

Mohammad expressed indignation 

at the treatment meted out to his 

deputy at an American airport and 

preached that all citizens of a partic-

ular country should not be treated 

like this due to the crimes committed 

by a few. 

He has conveniently forgotten 

that his country imposed additional 

paperwork and all kinds of barriers 

to citizens of Bangladesh who 

wished to visit Malaysia. 

Ironic, but amusing, that 

Mahathir cannot take the same 

treatment he doles out to the people 

from Bangladesh.

Abdullahil Baqui

China
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