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Outgoing Ambassador of Myanmar U Ohn Thwin called on Leader of the 
Opposition in Parliament and Awami League President Sheikh Hasina at her 
Sudha Sadan residence yesterday. 
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STAFF CORRESPONDENT 

Setting up of an unit of Apollo 
Hospitals Group of Kolkata in 
Dhaka is underway at a cost of Tk 
200 crore to provide most modern 
treatment facilities to Bangladeshi 
patients.

T h i s  w a s  s t a t e d  b y  V  
Satyanarayana Reddy, chief execu-
tive officer of the hospital at a press 
conference at a city hotel yesterday.

He said the unit would start 
functioning with the import of 
necessary medical equipment 
within the next three to six months. 
It will be housed at a building in 
Baridhara, he added.

Satyanarayana said an interna-
tional information centre has also 
been opened in Dhaka to facilitate 
treatment of Bangladeshi patients 
at the Apollo Gleneagles Hospitals 
in Kolkata.

The centre at Mohammadpur 
will provide counseling to patients 
seeking better medical treatment in 
the neighbouring country on medi-
cal referral, pre-travel medical 
advice, direct access to medical 
specialists,  accommodation,  
ticketing and visas, he added.

" W e  i n t e n d  t o  i n f o r m  
Bangladeshi patients how they can 
avail the latest diagnostic facilities 
and super medical service at Apollo 
Hospitals in Kolkata in a conve-
nient and cost-effective manner 
through this centre," said Dr 
Amitava Pahari.

The centre aims at providing 
d e t a i l e d  i n f o r m a t i o n  t o  
Bangladeshi patients about its 
special health care services spend-

ing less money and labour, said 
Tamal Bhattachariya, director of 
Apollo Hospitals. 

He said to provide world-class 
healthcare facilities to the people of 
the region, Apollo Hospitals Group 
has opened its latest 325-bed unit 
in Kolkata in collaboration with 
Singapore-based Parkway Group 
Healthcare. 

Dr Saw Chit Aung was present at 
the press conference on behalf of 
the Parkway Group. 

UNB, Dhaka

O u t g o i n g  A m b a s s a d o r  o f  
Myanmar U Ohn Thwin called on 
Leader of the Opposition in 
Parliament and Awami League 
President Sheikh Hasina at her 
Sudha Sadan residence yesterday. 

The envoy thanked Hasina for 
her assistance and cooperation 
during the tenure of AL govern-
ment in discharging his duties and 
mentioned his  activit ies  to 

strengthen bilateral relations 
between the two neighbouring 
countries. 

He said Myanmar was one of the 
first countries to accord recogni-
tion to Bangladesh after the War of 
Liberation. 

Hasina said the friendly rela-
tions between the peoples of the 
two countries have been existing 
for long. Many people had taken 
shelter in Myanmar during the War 
of Liberation, she added. 

She said both Bangladesh and 
Myanmar are member countries of 
regional umbrella BIMSTEC and 
should work together to improve 
the peoples' economic and social 
conditions. 

AL General secretary Abdul Jalil 
MP, AL International Affairs 
Secretary Syed Abul Hossain MP 
and Hasina's Press Adviser Jawadul 
Karim were present at the meeting. 

Apollo Hospital to be 
set up in Dhaka 

Myanmar envoy calls on Hasina 

Enamul Kabir 
made envoy to 
Bhutan
BSS, Dhaka

The government has decided to 
appoint Mohammed Enamul 
Kabir, currently deputy high com-
missioner of  Bangladesh in 
Karachi, as the ambassador to 
Bhutan.

A career diplomat, Kabir had 
served as director general in the 
Ministry of Foreign Affairs before 
he was appointed deputy high 
commissioner in Karachi. 
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