
Hamburg at the Munich Olympic 
Stadium after recent Japanese 
recruit Naohiro Takahara scored 
with an injury-time header past 
Bayern keeper Oliver Kahn. 

D e s p i t e  B a y e r n ' s  d r a w,  
Dortmund's defeat to a 77th minute 
goal by Stuttgart's Croatian interna-
tional Zvonimir Soldo means they 
now trail their bitter rivals by eight 
points. 

Bayern took the lead through 
through Peruvian international 
Claudio Pizarro after 11 minutes but 
as the seconds ticked down 
Takahara, who moved to Hamburg 
from Jubilo Iwata in December, 
grabbed his first Bundesliga goal 
when he connected with a cross 
from Iranian international Mehdi 
Mahdavikia. 

Kahn was beaten for the first time 
in 802 minutes of football, breaking 
his own Bundesliga record of 736 
minutes set in the 1998/99 season. 

Meanwhile Bayer Leverkusen 
coach Klaus Toppmoller could be 
out of a job after his former club VfL 
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1. Name who became AFC's team 
of the month in January

   Bangladesh        Sri Lanka        
India

       

2. Who finished first in the Prof 
Abdur Razzak 29th National 
C h e s s  C h a m p i o n s h i p  
qualifiers?

       Nasir  A m i n u l               
Taibur

3. Who clinched the Pan Pacific 
Open tennis title?

      Davenport     Hingis       
Serena

4. Bangladesh beat KwaZulu-
Natal in their second  World 

Competition closes at 8 pm
Feb 22,  2003 and draw

shortly afterwards

Tick the correct answers, post to 

Win attractive prizes

COMPETITION 190

BTV
Cricket World Cup 2003 

Preliminary Round
Bangladesh vs Canada

Live at 6:15 pm
February 12 (Wednesday)

India vs Netherlands
Live at 1:45 pm

February 13 (Thursday)
West Indies vs New Zealand

Live at 1:45 pm
February 14 (Friday)

Sri Lanka vs Bangladesh
Live at 1:45 pm

ESPN 
English Premier Football League

Man United vs Man City
Repeat at 10:30 am

Taking Guard Two 3
WC Cricket Talk Show

Live at 1:00 pm
Western Union World Football

Repeat at 6:00 pm
Football Focus
Live at 6:30 pm

Sportscentre Hindi
Sport News

Live at 8:30 pm
Follow Through Day 3
WC Cricket Programme

Live at 10:00 pm

STAR Sports 
Asia Sport Show
Int'l Sports News

Repeat at 11:00 am
Taking Guard Day 3
WC Cricket Talk Show

Live at 1:00 pm
Sportsline Tonight

Sport News
Live at 8:00 pm

PHOTO: AFP

WELCOME TO CHINA: Brazilian superstar Ronaldinho (C) arrives amid tight security at his hotel in Guangzhou 
yesterday. World Champions Brazil will play China on 12 February in a friendly international.

AFP,  Milan

Manchester United missed a golden 
opportunity to close the gap on 
Arsena l  a t  the  top o f  the  
Premiership, conceding a late goal 
to draw 1-1 against Manchester City 
while the Gunners were also held 1-
1 by Newcastle.

In a day of high drama in the top 
English division, United took an 
early lead against their local rivals 
through Ruud van Nistelrooy, and 
looked to be cruising to an easy win, 
which would bring them level with 
Arsenal on points.

But they missed a host of 
chances, living to regret their mis-
takes when Shaun Goater nodded 
home an 86th minute equaliser - 
nine seconds after he took the pitch 
as a substitute.

"It is a blow," admitted United 
manager Alex Ferguson.

"We spurned our opportunities."
Passions were equally high in 

the later game at St James's Park 
where Newcastle were looking to 
push the leaders all the way to the 
wire by re-taking third place from 
Chelsea.

However in the 35th minute 
Arsenal took the lead through the 
prolific Thierry Henry, his 18th 
Premiership goal of the season, and 
the Londoners looked to be cruising 
to a win.

But a moment of genius from 
French midfielder Laurent Robert 
early in the second half saw him 
slalom through the Gunners' 
defence and hit the ball past David 
Seaman.

In a bizarre twist Robert then got 
himself sent off within five minutes 
of his equaliser, picking up a pair of 
bookings inside two minutes, the 
latter for preventing Dennis 
Bergkamp taking a free kick.

However Arsenal failed to take 
advantage of their numerical superi-
ority as Newcastle defended hero-
ically with a series of last-ditch 
clearances.

They might even have snatched 

a win after Craig Bellamy's stop-
page-time cross forced a desperate 
save from Seaman.

The Gunners thus ended the day 
with the same three-point lead over 
Manchester United that they began 
it with.

Despite their host of missed 
chances at Old Trafford, the Red 
Devils could even count themselves 
lucky with such an outcome.

In an astonishing last few min-
utes, after equalising, Goater put 
the ball back in the United net again, 
only to see it disallowed for a hand-
ball by Nicolas Anelka.

Blues manager Kevin Keegan, 

so often criticised as tactically naive, 
was the architect of United's down-
fall as late substitutes Shaun Wright 
Phillips, Ali Benarbia and Goater 
combined to snatch the goal.

"If it worked like that every week 
you would be delighted," Keegan 
said of the substitutions.

He added: "If Arsene Wenger or 
Alex Ferguson had done it, they 
would have been hailed as a tactical 
genius, with me it's just luck."

The day began badly for Keegan 
when first choice goalkeeper Peter 
Schmeichel had to pull out after 
aggravating a calf injury in the pre-
match warm-up.

City then crumbled after just 17 
minutes. Roy Keane - playing his 
first Manchester derby since his 
infamous foul on City's Alf-Inge 
Haaland in April 2000 - spotted 
Ryan Giggs on the left and hit a first 
time ball through.

With the City defence in disarray, 
Giggs fired in a first time cross which 
van Nistelrooy gleefully smashed 
home for his 27th goal of the sea-
son.

However City came out fighting 
after the break. Marshalled by a 
superb Eyal Berkovic they battled 
back into the game.

Still United could - and should - 
have finished it.

Beckham narrowly missed with 
three close range free-kicks, while 
in the 55th minute van Nistelrooy 
dithered too long when clear on 
goal.

But City began to smell an upset, 
and Keegan sent on Wright Phillips 
as a substitute, soon followed by 
Benarbia and Goater.

The trio combined perfectly, with 
Wright Phil l ips knocking on 
Benarbia's free kick for Goater to 
head powerfully home.

"It's a derby, it means everything 
for our fans," Goater beamed after-
wards.

At St James's Park the frantic 
and often bad-tempered game was 
changed by the controversial send-
ing-off.

Newcastle players were visibly 
angry after Bergkamp took his free 
kick early, when Robert stood in the 
way.

"Laurent was just a yard away, 
what could he do?" fumed former 
England captain Alan Shearer.

Premiership

Top two held

AFP, Barcelona

The arrival of Radomir Antic as 
Barcelona's new coach made only a 
minimal difference to the fortunes of 
the Catalan giant as they squan-
dered a two-goal lead to finish 2-2 
against Athletic Bilbao on Sunday.

The result at the Nou Camp 
ended Barca's three-game losing 
streak but still leaves them in 15th 
place in the Spanish first division, 
their lowest ever position, and only 
two points above the relegation 
zone. 

Barca were two up after just 11 
minutes with goals from Javier 
Saviola and Marc Overmars.

However, Athletic tightened up at 
the back and thwarted Bracelona for 
the rest of the first half before getting 
quickly back on level terms after the 
break.

Santiago Ezquerro got one back 
for the Basques from the penalty 
spot after 49 minutes after new 
signing Juan Pablo Roman had 
brought down Tiko Martinez.

Five minutes later, Francisco 
Yeste equalised for Athletic after 
Tiko's free kick had bounced off 
three players before falling at his 
feet.

At the top of the table, Real 
Sociedad saw their lead dwindle to 
just two points after a goalless draw 
w i t h  r e l e g a t i o n - t h r e a t e n e d  
Espanyol. 

The Basques have 44 points 
from 21 games, two ahead of Real 
Madrid who beat Real Betis 4-1 on 
Saturday. 

"Espanyol kept us under control 
for the entire game but we slipped 
up, pure and simple," reflected 
Sociedad's French coach Raynald 
Denoueix. 

Sociedad's best chance came 
when Darko Kovacevic headed 
against the crossbar just a minute 
after half-time.

E s p a n y o l  c o a c h  J a v i e r  
Clemente, whose team have only 
lost once in seven games since he 
took over in December, preferred to 
look forward. 

"Next week, we are at home in 
the derby (against Barcelona) and 
three points there will go a long way 
to getting us out of danger," said the 
former Spain coach. 

Valencia lost ground on the 
leading duo in Spain after drawing 
1-1 with lowly Recreativo Huelva.

The reigning Spanish champions 
remain third with 39 points from 21 
games.

Raul Molina got his eighth goal of 
the season for Recreativo, firing 
home a thunderbolt from the edge of 
the box after 31 minutes. 

Valencia threw everything at the 
bottom club could not draw level 
until five minutes before the whistle 
when Fabio Aurelio scored direct 
from a free kick.

"We didn't adapt to either our 
rival or their pitch," admitted 
Valencia coach Rafa Benitez, 
adding his voice to the chorus of 
disapproval about the state of the 
playing surface Recreativo's Nuevo 
Colombino stadium. 

Various complaints have been 
made to the league although no 
action has yet been taken. 

There was disappointment also 
for Deportivo La Coruna, who were 
held 1-1 at home by Osasuna but 
they remain fourth with 36 points. 

Osasuna took the lead a minute 
after the break when Inaki Munoz 
tapped the ball into the net after 
Deportivo goalkeeper Juanmi 
Garica flapped at a cross from 
Gerardo Rivero. 

Deportivo were in further trouble 
just after the hour, when Spanish 
international striker Diego Tristan 
picked up his second yellow card 
and the hosts were reduced to 10 
men. 

However Deportivo salvaged a 

Primera Liga

No Barca antics 

AFP, Milan

Inter Milan returned to the top of 
Italy's Serie A on Sunday after 
thrashing Reggina 3-0 at the San 
Siro while city rivals AC Milan 
crashed to a surprise 1-0 defeat at 
Perugia. 

The architect of Milan's downfall 
was Fabrizio Miccoli, who cele-
brated his first call-up to the Italy 
squad on Saturday by scoring the 
winner nine minutes from half time. 

The 23-year-old forward rifled a 
superb 25-metre shot on the half-
volley which arrowed into the top 
corner past Milan's helpless 
Brazilian goalkeeper Dida to clinch 
a memorable victory. 

Victory for Serse Cosmi's men 
came three days after the teams 
drew 0-0 in their Italian Cup semi-
final first leg clash and was their 
second famous scalp this year 
having thumped Inter 4-1 last 
month. 

Milan, who were top at the start of 
play, dropped to second following 
Inter's easy victory over the 
Calabrians. 

Inter have 45 points from 20 
matches, three more than Milan and 
third-placed Juventus, who won on 
Saturday. 

Milan coach Carlo Ancelotti 
admitted Miccoli's goal was worthy 
of winning any match. 

"It was a truly magnificent goal - 
let's hope he can do that for Italy on 
Wednesday," Ancelotti said. 

Ancelotti lamented his side's 
inability to put away more of their 
chances, which has allowed Inter 
and Juventus to gain ground on the 
16-time champions. 

"All of our problems are in the 
final third of the pitch," he said. "We 
still look solid elsewhere, but if you 
don't score, you don't win matches. 
This is not a positive period for us." 

Miccoli refused to take all the 

credit for Perugia's win which lifted 
them to ninth place. 

"I'm always happy to score but 
today is all about the squad," he 
said. "It was an incredible perfor-
mance. To beat Milan is very spe-
cial." 

Christian Vieri gave Inter a 10th-
minute lead against Reggina with a 
crisp volley before being substituted 
on the half hour mark after injuring 
his right knee. 

The Italy international, who looks 

likely to miss Italy's friendly against 
Portugal on Wednesday, needs just 
one more goal to reach the 100 
mark in Serie 

Vieri's replacement Mohamed 
Kallon scored twice before half-
time, the second from the penalty 
spot after Turkish midfielder Emre 
Belozoglu was scythed down in the 
box. 

Inter coach Hector Cuper said it 
was too early to tell how serious 
Vieri's injury was. 

"It's very difficult to say. He's 
injured that knee before. We will 
wait for the tests next week," Cuper 
said.

Lazio remain fourth but lost 
ground in the race for the champion-
ship after being held to a disappoint-
ing 1-1 draw by bottom club Torino. 

Argentine midfielder Diego 
Simeone converted Enrico Chiesa's 
corner to give Lazio the lead, before 
Torino veteran Marco Ferrante 
levelled the scores by heading 
home Daniele Martinelli's cross. 

In the day's other early action 
Greek defender Traianos Dellas' 
90th minute equaliser earned AS 
Roma a 1-1 draw at Modena, while 
Brescia drew 0-0 at home to Chievo. 

Two converted penalty kicks 
from Romanian international Adrian 
Mutu secured a 2-2 draw for Parma 
at strugglers Como. 

In Sunday's late match Atalanta 
continued their impressive form that 
has seen them pull out of the relega-
tion zone with a last-gasp 3-2 win at 
Bologna. 

Two goals from Alex Pinardi gave 
Atalanta a 2-0 lead, before former 
Italy international Guiseppe Signori 
converted two penalties in four 
second-half minutes. 

But just as it seemed as if both 
sides had settled for a draw, up 
popped Fausto Rossini to scored a 

dramatic injury-time winner for 
Giovanni Vavassori's men. 

On Saturday reigning champions 
Juventus made sure they stayed in 
the title hunt with a scrappy 1-0 win 
at home to Empoli. 

French international David 
Trezeguet scored the decisive goal 
from the penalty spot after Empoli 
defender Sanchez Emilson Cribari 
handled Pavel Nedved's left-wing 
cross. 

Juve looked short of ideas in 
attack without their injured captain 
Alessandro Del Piero. 

The Italy international is 
expected to miss two months of the 
season after damaging a thigh 
muscle last week at Atalanta. 

However, Trezeguet's seventh 
minute spot-kick was enough to 
overcome the Tuscans, who have 
won more games away from home 
than at their Carlo Castellani sta-
dium since being promoted from 
Serie B. 

In Saturday's other match rele-
gation-threatened Piacenza lost 2-1 
at Udinese who have 

not lost at home in the league this 
season.

Serie A

Inter break clear

AFP, Berlin 

Reigning champions Borussia 
Dortmund crashed to a 1-0 defeat to 
VfB Stuttgart on Sunday which saw 
them drop further behind Bayern 
Munich in the race for the German 
title. 

Bayern were held 1-1 by SV 

Bundesliga

Champions stunned

Leading scorers in the English 
Premiership after Sunday's 
matches:

18 - Thierry Henry (Arsenal)
16 - James Beattie (Southampton)
14 - Alan Shearer (Newcastle)
12 - Ruud van Nistelrooy (Man-
chester United)
11 - Nicolas Anelka (Manchester 
City), Gianfranco Zola (Chelsea)
10 - Robbie Keane (Tottenham), 
Harry Kewell (Leeds)
9 - Michael Owen (Liverpool), 
Tomasz Radzinski (Everton), Dion 
Dublin (Aston Vil la), Eidur 
Gudjohnsen (Chelsea)
8 - Jason Euell (Charlton), Paul 
Scholes (Manchester United), 
Sylvain Wiltord (Arsenal)

TOP SCORERS

Leading scorers in the German 
Bundesliga after Sunday's 
matches:

14 - Ailton (Werder Bremen)
12 - Thomas Christiansen (VfL 
Bochum)
11 - Giovane Elber (Bayern 
Munich), Markus Schroth (1860 
Munich), Sasa Ciric (Nuremberg)
10 -  Kevin Kuranyi  (VfB 
Stuttgart), Ewerthon (Borussia 
Dortmund), Benjamin Lauth 
(1860 Munich)
9 - Fredi Bobic (Hanover), Jan 
Koller (Dortmund)
8 - Bernardo Romeo (Hamburg), 
Claudio Pizarro (Bayern Munich), 
M o h a m m a d o u  I d r i s s o u  
(Hanover), Marcelinho (Berlin)

TOP SCORERS

Leading scorers in the Italian 
league after the weekend's 
matches: 

18 - Christian Vieri (Inter Milan) 
12 - Alessandro Del Piero 
(Juventus) 
11 - Francesco Totti (AS Roma), 
Adrian Mutu (Parma)
10 - Claudio Lopez (Lazio) 
9 - Filippo Inzaghi (AC Milan), 
Adriano (Parma)
8 - Julio Cruz (Bologna), Antonio 
Di Natale (Empoli), Andrea 
PirloMilan), Roberto Baggio 
(Brescia) 
7 - Guiseppe Signori (Bologna)
6 - Tommaso Rocchi (Empoli), 
Bernardo Corradi (Lazio), Alvaro 
Recoba (Inter Milan), Igli Tare 
(Brescia), Federico Cossato 
(Chievo), Diego Simeone (Lazio), 
Fabrizio Miccoli (Perugia)

TOP SCORERS

Leading scorers in the Spanish 
league after the weekend's 
matches: 

15 - Roy Makaay (Deportivo La 
Coruna) 
11 - Darko Kovacevic (Real 
Sociedad) 
10 -  Nihat  Kahveci  (Real  
Sociedad), Patrick Kluivert (Barce-
lona), Walter Pandiani (Real 
Mallorca), Fernando Torres 
(Atletico Madrid) 
9 - Ismael Urzaiz (Athletic Bilbao), 
Raul Gonzalez (Real Madrid), Luis 
Figo (Real Madrid), Ronaldo (Real 
Madrid) 
8 - Julio Alvarez (Rayo Vallecano), 
Kiki Musampa (Malaga), Joseba 
Etxeberria (Athletic Bilbao) Raul 
Molina (Recreativo Huelva) 
7 - John Carew (Valencia) 

TOP SCORERS

English Premiership table after 
Sunday's matches (played, won, 
drawn, lost, goals for, goals 
against, points):

Arsenal  27  17  6  4  57  29  57
Man Utd  27  16  6  5  44  25  54
Newcastle  26  15  4  7  42  32  49
Chelsea  27  13  9  5  48  27  48
Everton  27  13  6  8  35  32  45
Liverpool  27  11  10  6  38  26  43

TOP SIX

Italian football league table after 
Sunday's matches (played, won, 
drawn, lost, goals for, goals against, 
points):

Inter Milan  20  14  3  3  42  20  45
AC Milan  20  13  3  4  36  14  42
Juventus  20  12  6  2  36  14  42
Lazio   20  10  8  2  35  19  38
Chievo  20  10  4  6  29  19  34
Udinese  20  9  5  6  21  20  32

TOP SIX

Spanish football league table on 
Sunday (played, won, drawn, lost, 
goals for, against, points): 
 
Sociedad  21  12  8  1  36  24  44 
Real  21  11  9  1  46  22  42 
Valencia 21  11  6  4  34  17  39 
Deportivo  21  10  6  5  30  25  36 
Celta  21  10  3  8  24  19  33 
Betis  21  9  6  6  32  28  33

TOP SIX

German league table af ter  
Sunday's matches (played, won, 
drawn, lost, goals for, against):

Bayern  20  13  5  2  40  15  44
Dortmund  20  10  6  4  31  16  36
Stuttgart  20  10  6  4  33  24  36
Bremen  20  10  4  6  37  32  34
Schalke  20  8  8  4  27  21  32
Munich  20  9  4  7  31  27  31

TOP SIX

Bochum administered a 2-1 away 
defeat on Saturday. 

A double strike from Bochum's 
Iranian internat ional Vashid 
H a s h e m i a n  c o m p l e t e d  
Leverkusen 's  jou rney  f rom 
Champions League finalists last 
season to relegation candidates. 

Hashemian came on as a substi-
tute on the hour and within eight 
minutes had driven a shot past 
Hans-Jorg Butt. 

Croatian international Marko 
Babic brought Leverkusen level with 
12 minutes remaining at the 
Ruhrstadion but Hashemian col-
lected a pass from South African 
international Delron Buckley to 
score the winner in the 84th minute. 

The defeat left Leverkusen, last 
year's Bundesliga runners-up, 
fourth from bottom and Toppmoller, 
who joined the club from Bochum in 
2001, acknowledged his future was 
no longer in his hands. 

Werder Bremen slumped to a 2-1 
home defeat to 1860 Munich but 
Hertha Berlin hit form with a 4-2 
defeat of Schalke 04 in the capital. 

Kaiserslautern finally moved off 
the bottom with a 2-0 home win over 
Boruss ia  Moncheng ladbach 
achieved wi th a goal  f rom 
Aleksander Knavs and a Miroslav 
Klose penalty. 

Energie Cottbus dropped to 
bottom spot after a 0-0 draw with 
Hansa Rostock. 

point two minutes later when Roy 
Makaay connected with an Albert 
Luque cross for his 15th goal of the 
season and Deportivo's 1,500th in 
the Spanish first division. 

Celta bounced back after their 
recent spell of poor form with a 
convincing 2-0 win at Real Mallorca, 
both their second half goals coming 
from the Galicians' Brazilian striker 
Edu, who got his brace within the 
space of 11 minutes. 

The victory in the Balearics 
means that Celta move up a place 
to fifth.

Struggling Rayo Vallecano got 
the quickest goal of the day when 
Michel Sanchez scored after just 
four minutes in their 2-1 victory over 
Malaga. 

FROM PAGE 16

England. 
Logie, however, was confident 

his team has come a long way since. 
"The wickets are harder here, but 

they've seen the South African 
players and the international teams. 
They are mentally strong enough to 
handle the conditions," he said. 
Canada are led by Madras-born 
Joseph Harris, a handy batsman 
who boasts of a healthy ICC Trophy 
average of just over 41. Off-spinner 
John Davison, who has played with 
Victoria in Australia, will be 
expected to take wickets.
LINE-UPS 
BANGLADESH (from): Khaled 
Mashud (captain), Al Shahriar, Alok 
Kapali, Habibul Bashar, Hannan 
Sarker, Ehsanul Haque, Sanwar 
Hossain, Khaled Mahmud, Manjurul 
I s l a m ,  M a s h r a f e  M o r t a z a ,  
Mohammad Ashraful, Mohammad 
Rafique, Talha Jubair, Tapash 
Baisya, Tushar Imran. 
CANADA (from): Joseph Harris 
(captain), Ashish Bagai, Ian Billcliff, 
Desmond Chumney,  Aus t in  
Codrington, John Davison, Nicholas 
de Groot, Nicholas Ifil, Davis 
Joseph, Ishwar Maraj, Ashish Patel, 
Abdool Samad, Fazil Sattaur, Barry 
Seebaran, Sanjayan Thuraisingam. 

Umpires: Brian Jerling (Rsa) and 
Aleem Dar (Pak) 

TV umpire: Avi Jayaprakash 
(Ind) 

Match referee: Gundappa 
Vishwanath (Pak

Nothing than 
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income coming from the proceeds 
of international matches, the effect 
of a South African withdrawal opens 
up an even more appalling prospect 
for the ECB. 

On Sunday, the ECB who have 
exhausted all official attempts at 
getting their Harare fixture moved to 
main hosts South Africa, handed a 
dossier to International Cricket 
Council (ICC) chiefs which they said 
contained new security information. 

That dossier has been passed to 
South Africa's second highest 
ranking police officer, Andre Pruis 
who is due to provide an assess-
ment to the ICC later Monday. 

However, as Zimbabwe are 
adamantly opposed to relocating 
the fixture, England must either play 
the match in Harare or risk losing 
four World Cup points as well as 
incurring a fine for failing to honour 
their contractual obligations. 

It appears now they are pinning 
their hopes on World Cup chiefs 
calling off the game and awarding 
both sides two points. But that would 
represent a huge U-turn on the part 
of the game's rulers. 

African solidarity 
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Seebaran, Fazal Samad, Ishwar 
Maraj, a top order batsman from 
Trinidad, Nick Ifill, also from the 
West Indies and Ian Billcliff who has 
played in New Zealand. 

"One thing is certain. We will not 
be overawed by the occasion of our 
opening game because we are 
physically and mentally prepared," 
the former West Indian Test player 
told SAPA news agency. 

Bangladesh find themselves in 
the unusual position of favourites 
which means they have the perfect 
opportunity to break their embar-
rassing sequence of 26 successive 
defeats. 

WC dessert!
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Pakistan at Centurion Park at a 
group match of the just-started 
World Cup tournament. 

"No matter which team wins, 
cricket will win. Youthfulness will 
win. The spirit of oneness will win. 
(But) of course, we in India would 
very much like our boys in blue to 
win," he said. 

India last clashed with Pakistan 
at the Asia Cup in Dhaka three years 
ago before breaking sporting ties 
with its adversary saying Islamabad 
must first put a halt to militancy in 
Kashmir. 

The two arch-rivals could have 
clashed during last year's ICC mini-
World Cup tournament in Sri Lanka 
had Pakistan reached the finals. 

The two South Asian nations, 
however, played each other during 
last year's under-19 World Cup 
event in Australia. 

Sources say Vajpayee loves to 
watch cricket, especially when an 
Indian team is involved. 

Always cricket 
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Smith stoked the debate still further, 
suggesting in his book, to be pub-
l i s h e d  o n  S a t u r d a y,  t h a t  
Muralitharan was breaking the 
game's rules.

Smith said: "The Sri Lankan off-
spinner throws rather than bowls the 
ball.

"I've heard all about how he's 
had a deformity since birth and 
therefore unable to straighten his 
right arm. If that's the case, then 
that's bad luck for Murali.

"He's still breaking the laws of 
cricket and therefore should not be 
allowed to bowl."

He said: "He (Murali) wants to 
win the World Cup, so do we, and it 
is affecting him.

"He's taken a few things person-
ally and it's hard not to. He realizes 
he's in the public eye and he's big 
news all the time, but sometimes 
you can destroy him if you go too 
far."

Jayasuriya's fear
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what they have seen and, as far 

as we are concerned, we have no 

reason not to trust their decision." 

Ponting was also keen to 

distance himself from both 

England's decision on whether or 

not to play in Zimbabwe, as well 

as any perceived moral issues 

surrounding matches in the coun-

try, which is currently facing social 

and political unrest. 

"We have got completely 

different circumstances to them 

(England), " he said. 

"Our board and the ICC have 

done everything in their powers to 

ensure our safety, have reported 

back to us that everything over 

there looks very good and the 

players are happy with that. 

"We are not ignoring or con-

doning what's happening in that 

country," Ponting added. 

"But as far as we are con-

cerned we are cricketers going 

there to play well and get some 

World Cup points on the board."

Aussies are 
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